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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

INFORMATION GOVERANCE TEAM

1. How many shifts per month were sent out for locum agencies to fill?
Response:

The information for requests is not recorded — only filled agency posts filled are recorded
and logged.

2. How many of these shifts were filled, by framework agency per month?

Response:

23/24 Number of 2024 Number of

shifts filled shifts filled

April 23 18 April 24 10
May 23 21 May 24 10
June 23 31 June 24 11
July 23 37 July 24 17
Aug 23 31 Aug 24 16
Sept 23 27 Sept 24 12

Oct 23 31

Nov 23 18

Dec 23 18

Jan 24 16

Feb 24 16

March 24 17

3. How many shifts per month were filled, by off-framework agency per month?

Response:

No off-framework agencies booked from April 23 — Sept 24 through the Resourcing Team.

4. How many of these shifts were unfilled per month?

Response:

As per above the number of shifts unfilled per month is not recorded.




5. How many agency locum staff have you currently working in each category for
each agency?

Response:

Job Category Number of requests
Admin & Clerical 279

AHP 12

Estates 7
Professional & Technical 19

Social Care 33

Support Services 6

357

6. What did the trust spend per month, for each framework and non-framework
agency supplier?

Response:
Please see attached spreadsheet.

Note
****Q1-5 are exclusive of Support Services which is not included in the figures above.

Email: foi.team@southerntrust.hscni.net
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