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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 – INFORMATION REQUEST 

 
 
Question 1. 
Do you have an Electronic Patient Record (EPR) system in place? 
 
Response: 
The Trust does not currently have an EPR but are at the early stages of implementation 
of the EPIC EPR. 
 
 
Question 2. 
If so, what EPR is deployed? 
 
Response: 
See response to Question 1. 
 
 
Question 3. 
What is the value of the EPR contract, either annually or total contract value? 
 
Response: 
The Trust does not hold this information as the EPR is a regional system across 
Northern Ireland.  The Business Services Organisation may hold this information, their 
contact email address is FOI.bso@hscni.net if you wish to contact them directly. 
 
 
Question 4. 
When is the current EPR contract due for renewal? 
 
Response: 
The Trust does not hold this information as the EPR is a regional system across 
Northern Ireland.  The Business Services Organisation may hold this information, their 
contact email address is FOI.bso@hscni.net if you wish to contact them directly. 
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