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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

The name and email address of the person with your Health board that holds the
following job titles:

1. Senior Information Risk Officer (SIRO) - Elaine Wilson -
Elaine.WilsonDoP @southerntrust.hscni.net

2. Chief Information Officer (ClIO) — No such Job Title in SHSCT - Information not held

3. Chief Information Security Officer (CISO) — No such Job Title in SHSCT -
Information not held

4. Director of Information Technology — No such Job Title in SHSCT - Information
not held

5. Head of Governance — No such Job Title in SHSCT - Information not held

6. Caldicott Guardian - No such Job Title in SHSCT — Personal Data Guardian — Dr
Stephen Austin - stephen.austin@southerntrust.hscni.net

7. Head of Risk/Compliance — No such Job Title in SHSCT - Information not held

Email: Foi.Team@ Southerntrust.hscni.net
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