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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

Question 1:

How many state hospitals provide a psychodermatology service on-site in your
area? Please name them.

Response:
Information not held - The Southern Trust do not provide a Psychodermatology Service
Question 2:

How many patients with eczema in your area have accessed psychodermatology
services in the last 12 months?

Response:
Information not held - The Southern Trust do not provide a Psychodermatology Service
Question 3:

How many patients with eczema are on the waiting list to access
psychodermatology services?

Response:
Information not held - The Southern Trust do not provide a Psychodermatology Service
Question 4:

How long, on average, are patients with eczema on the waiting list to access
psychodermatology services?

Response:

Information not held - The Southern Trust do not provide a Psychodermatology Service



Question 5:

What % of patients with eczema in your area currently accessing
psychodermatology services have to travel outside of the county in which they
live to access them?

Response:

Information not held - The Southern Trust do not provide a Psychodermatology Service
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