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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

1. Inthelast 3 months (July, August, and September 2023), how many
Haemophilia A, Haemophilia B and von Willebrand patients were treated in your
trust with the following coagulation factors:

Hemlibra (non-inhibitor patients)
Hemlibra (inhibitor patients)
Advate
Adynovi
Elocta
Esperoct
NovoEight
ReFacto AF
Nuwiq
Idelvion
Refixia
Alprolix
BeneFIX
Replenine
Rixubis
Voncento
Veyvondi
Wilate
Willfact
Alphanate
Octanate
Optivate
Fahndi
Haemate

XE<ECOTETOSITATTSQTOQ0T

Response to question 1: This information is not recorded.

2. Inthelast 3 months (July, August, and September 2023), how much volume
in IU or mg was used of the following coagulation factors:

Hemlibra (non-inhibitor patients)
Hemlibra (inhibitor patients)
Advate

Adynovi

coop



Elocta
Esperoct
NovoEight
ReFacto AF
Nuwiq
Idelvion
Refixia
Alprolix
BeneFIX
Replenine
Rixubis
Voncento
Veyvondi
Wilate
Willfact
Alphanate
Octanate
Optivate
Fahndi
Haemate

XE<ECOmLeTOSITATIIQTO

Response to question 2: This information is not recorded.

3. Inthelast 3 months (July, August, and September 2023), how many patients
switched from one of the following products to any other brand? Please indicate
the brand that was switched to (i.e. Advate: 2 switches to Hemlibra, 3 switches to
Elocta)

Hemlibra (non-inhibitor patients)
Hemlibra (inhibitor patients)
Advate
Adynovi
Elocta
Esperoct
NovoEight
ReFacto AF
Nuwiq
Idelvion
Refixia
Alprolix
BeneFIX
Replenine
Rixubis
Voncento
Veyvondi
Wilate
Willfact
Alphanate
Octanate
Optivate
Fahndi
Haemate

XS<CCmVWTOeTOS3ITATITQ@N0Q0TY
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Response to question3: All products issued were from the same manufacturer and were

the same batch number.

Email: FOl.team@ Southerntrust.hscni.net
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