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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

1. Thetypes or brands of wound dressings currently used by Southern Health
and Social Care Trust (Northern Ireland).

COMPRESSION BANDAGING AND COMPONENTS
TRADITIONAL WOUND DRESSINGS

TAPING

TRADITIONAL BANDAGES

ORTHOPAEDIC PRODUCTS

DEVICE SECURAL

DRAPES/DRAPE PACKS

DRAPES/DRAPES

SKIN INTEGRITY PRODUCTS

WOUND AND POST-OPERATIVE

WOUND CLOSURE

BALLS COTTON WOOL

SWABS, GAUZE, TIED-5, STERILE

SWABS, GAUZE, X-RAY DETECTABLE, TIED-5, NON STERILE
SWABS, GAUZE, X-RAY DETECTABLE, TIED-5, STERILE
SWABS, NON WOVEN, NON-STERILE

TOPICAL NEGATIVE PRESSURE THERAPY

SWABS, NON WOVEN, STERILE

DRESSINGS ANTIBACTERIAL

HAEMOSTATIC DRESSINGS AND DEVICES

TISSUE ADHESIVE

BURNS AND SCAR MANAGEMENT

COMPRESSION GARMENTS

DEBRIDEMENT SKIN AND WOUNDS

REHABILITATION

SWABS, GAUZE, NON-STERILE

SWABS LEMON AND GLYCERIN

SWABS, GAUZE PLEDGETS, X-RAY DETECTABLE, STERILE
WIPES AND APPLICATORS

MATERNITY AND SANITARY

ADHESIVE REMOVER

COTTON WOOL ABSORBENT

NEUROSURGICAL PATTIES, COTTON, X-RAY DETECTABLE



LOW FRICTION PRODUCTS

SODIUM CHLORIDE PRE-FILLED FLUSHING SOLUTION FOR PARENTERAL
ADMINISTRATION

SWABS, GAUZE RIBBON, X-RAY DETECTABLE, STERILE
SWABS, NON WOVEN, TIED-5, STERILE

SWABS, SPONGE BALL, STERILE

N/A

Foam Wound Care Set

Gauze

Grip-Lok

Pump

PODIATRY

Medical Tape

. The sources of purchase for these wound dressings, including the names
of suppliers or vendors.

Source of purchases — BSO PALS (Business Services Organisation —
Procurement and Logistics Services)

3M UNITED KINGDOM PLC (EFIN)

AAH NI (EFIN)

AAH PHARMACEUTICALS LTD [SANGERS AAH] (ST)
ADVANCIS MEDICAL (ST)

ALLIANCE HEALTHCARE DISTRIBUTION LTD (ST)
BAXTER HEALTHCARE LTD (ST)

BIO DIAGNOSTICS LTD (ST)

BIOMONDE (ST)

BSN MEDICAL LTD (ST)

CARDIAC SERVICES LTD (ST)

COVIDIEN (UK) COMMERCIAL LTD (ST)

CREST MEDICAL LTD (ST)

CUXSON GERRARD & CO LTD (ST)

DELTA SURGICAL LTD (ST)

FANNIN (NI) LTD (ST)

FRESENIUS MEDICAL CARE IRELAND LTD (EFIN)
HEALTHCARE 21 (ST)

JOHNSON & JOHNSON MEDICAL LTD (ST)
JOHNSON BROS BELFAST LTD (ST)

KCI MEDICAL LTD (ST)

MAWDSLEY BROOKS & CO LTD (EFIN)

MEDIQ HEALTHCARE UK LTD (BUNZL HEALTHCARE) (ST)
MOVIANTO IRELAND (ST)

MOVIANTO UK (ST)

OXYGEN CARE LTD (ST)

PAUL HARTMANN LTD (ST)

PHOENIX HEALTHCARE DISTRIBUTION (BELFAST) (ST)
RELIANCE MEDICAL LTD (ST)




SANGERS SPECIALITY DISTRIBUTION (ST)
SANGERS SURGICAL (EFIN)

STEROPLAST HEALTHCARE LTD (ST)
URGO LTD (ST)

VYGON UK LTD (ST)

3. Whether these wound dressings contain chitosan as one of their
components or ingredients.

Information not held.

4. If available, any data or studies the hospital has regarding the efficacy of
these chitosan-based dressings.

Information not held.
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