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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

Question 1: What are the conditions that class as ‘“unsuitable housing’ or
‘clinically vulnerable’ pertaining to patients that require NHS safe places?
(Unsuitable housing leading to the provision of safe houses refers to the conditions that
means social services must be called as referred to in this article.
https://www.guysandstthomas.nhs.uk/news/safe-place-patients-who-are-homeless-
after-hospital-stay )

Response: Information not held

Question 2: How many cases of this have been reported each year?

Response: Information not held

Question 3: How many days did each patient stay?

Response: Information not held

Question 4: What were the reasons for their stay?

Response: Information not held

Question 5: How much did it cost to keep each patient?

Response: Information not held

Question 6: What was the reason for each patients’ discharge?

Response: Information not held
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