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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 — INFORMATION REQUEST

Question 1: How much did your Trust spend in total on education and training in
the following financial years?

Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - £1,359K
April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - £1,544K

Training provided by Southern Trust employees will not be reflected in these figures.

Question 2: Please advise how much of this total spend was with external
providers?

Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) — £1,038K
April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - £1,260K

Training provided by Southern Trust employees will not be reflected in these figures.

Question 3: Please can you break it down into the following categories?
Apprenticeship training

Response:

April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) — Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.



Mandatory, statutory and compliance training
Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.

Management and Leadership training
Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.

Healthcare support worker training
Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.

Nursing
Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.

Allied Healthcare Professionals
Response:
April to March 2021-2022 (overall spend) - Information not held.

April to March 2022- 2023 (overall spend) - Information not held.
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Question 4: What are the top five categories that you procure externally?

Response:

Information not held.

Email: Foi.Team@ Southerntrust.hscni.net
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