
 

 
     

 
 

 

 
FOI 2355 
 
14th May 2024 
 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 – INFORMATION REQUEST 

 
Q1. The total number of care beds within the Trust.  
 
Response: 
 
The Trust does not hold this information in relation to the Independent Sector.  RQIA 
may be able to assist.  
You may wish to redirect some of your questions to the RQIA. Contact details below: 
FOI.BSO@hscni.net  
 
The Trust has four Statutory Residential Homes with a total of 99 Residential beds. 
 
Q1. b - This total broken down by either private company provider or provided by 
the Trust. 
 
Response: 
 
The Trust does not hold the information in relation to the Independent Sector.  RQIA 
may be able to assist. 
The Trust has four Statutory Residential Homes with a total of 99 Residential beds. 
 
Q2. Of the above total number of beds, can you further break down into relevant 
categories i.e Residential, Residential EMI, Nursing and Nursing EMI. 
 
The Trust does not hold the information in relation to the Independent Sector. RQIA 
may be able to assist. 
 
Of the 99 Statutory Residential beds there are 68 registered beds for over 65 (I) – Old 
age not falling within any other category, 30 Dementia – elderly beds and 1 LD - 
Learning Disability for 1 identified person.  
 
Q3. Out of the total number - how many beds DO NOT have an additional top up 
fee  
Q3b. Can the above number be broken down further into Residential, residential 
EMI, nursing and Nursing EMI. 
 
The Trust does not hold the information on the total number of individual beds that carry 
a top up. As of 23 April 2024 there are 21 contracted Independent Sector Care Homes 
in the SHSCT that don’t apply a top up to their beds. 
  
Q4. Any data relating to the cost of above top up fees - highest, lowest or listed 
per provider 

Information Governance Team  
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As of the 23 April 2024 top up range from £25 - £80 per week however this is subject to 
change. 
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