
 

 

 
Information Governance Team  
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3rd December 2024  
 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 – INFORMATION REQUEST 
 
Question: In relation to your supply of locum Doctors for each grade and 
specialty per month, please could you provide the answers to the requests below 
for the following periods? 
 
i.      Financial year 2022/2023 
ii.     Financial year 2023/2024 
iii.    Period from April - September 2024 
 

1. Please confirm the total number of vacancy requirements given out to 
framework and non-framework agencies for each agency 

 
Response:  
This information is not recorded. 
 
 

2. Please confirm the total number of shifts given out to framework and non-
framework agencies for each agency 
 

Response:  
This information is not recorded. 
 
 

3. Please confirm the total number of agency locum doctors working per 
month, for each agency supplier divided between on and off framework. 

 
Response:  
Please see details below of the total shifts filled by the Medical Framework Agencies.  
We are unable to provide the breakdown of shifts/hours filled by grade and speciality as 
we do not currently record information in this way. 
 
 

4. Please confirm the total number of hours worked by agency locum 
doctors per month, for each agency supplier divided between on and off 
framework. 

 
Response:  
Please see details below of the total shifts filled by the Medical Framework Agencies.  
We are unable to provide the breakdown of shifts/hours filled by grade and speciality as 
we do not currently record information in this way. 
 



2022/2023 
 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr-
22 

May-
22 

Jun-
22 

Jul-
22 

Aug-
22 

Sep-
22 

Oct-
22 

Nov-
22 

Dec-
22 

Jan-
23 

Feb-
23 

Mar-
23 

Bond 27 16 8 19  31 22 4 8 5 89   

Direct 
Medics 

105 106 56 94 96 81 95 92 109 89 58 64 

ID Medical          1          

Interact 
Medical 

       6  3         

Locum 
Link 

7 15 16 34 16 16 23 16 9 7 11 10 

NC 
Healthcare  

13 10 12 10  10 11 11 18 21 8 12 

TLS 154 136 155 174 153  167 157  173 206 219 

TTM 4 12 3 21  170   181    

 
 
Please see details below of the total shifts filled by the Medical Non-Framework 
Agencies.   
 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr
-22 

May
-22 

Jun
-22 

Jul
-22 

Aug
-22 

Sep-
22 

Oct
-22 

Nov
-22 

Dec
-22 

Jan
-23 

Feb
-23 

Mar
-23 

Global 
Medics IE  

10  3 3   4 4 3 2 1 1 2 4 

Global 
Medics UK 

     4  4  3   6         

Locum 
Express 

      1  4             

Medicircle      1  5 5 12 6 11 8 

Mediteam     8 6 13 18 16 16   15 14 10  4  2  3 

Nutrix  1 1   4  1 2 1 10 16    16 

PE Global  8 2 2  22 7 19 8 7 8 12 16 12 

Resuscitate  8 12   12 9   13  8  12 6  11  3  10   17 

Surgi-Call  11 2 7 10 19 8 57 58 47 55 28 69 

Venture 7 1           

4 
Recruitmen
t Services 

       3 4    

CPL 
Healthcare 

     
 
8
  

4      

 
2023/2024 
 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr-
23 

May-
23 

Jun-
23 

Jul-
23 

Aug-
23 

Sep-
23 

Oct-
23 

Nov-
23 

Dec-
23 

Jan-
24 

Feb-
24 

Mar-
24 

Bond 3 6 11 1   7 1 1 2 2 2 3 



 

 

Direct 
Medics 

65 50 49 101 69 64 71 53 68 50 56 38 

ID Medical    4 2 2 3   2 3         

Interact 
Medical 

    3 5   12 6 7         

Locum 
Link 

16 15 20 20 22 8 9 11 18 27 7 6 

Locum 
People 

3       1           1 1 

National 
Locums 

        26 23 7 7 1   5   

NC 
Healthcare  

19 26 16 21 15 20 17 13 29 22 19 23 

TLS 228 279 242 354 196 227 240 198 224 162 163 172 

 
 
Please see details below of the total shifts filled by the Medical Non-Framework 
Agencies.   
 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr-
23 

May-
23 

Jun-
23 

Jul-
23 

Aug-
23 

Sep-
23 

Oct-
23 

Nov-
23 

Dec-
23 

Jan-
24 

Feb-
24 

Mar-
24 

Athona           1         7 2 

DRC 
Locums 

                2       

Global 
Medics IE  

1 54 6 2 3 11 5 9 6 3 17 13 

Global 
Medics UK 

      2 2       1       

Healthcare 
Resource 
Company 

  5 2   11               

Medicircle  6 5 2 7 6 5 1 5 9 3 3 5 

Mediteam  1 5 2 1 1     2 5       

Nutrix  9 12 8 10 23 29 27 29 33 29 23 22 

PE Global  9 7   11 10 5 12 10 9 10 5 9 

Resuscitate  13                       

Surgi-Call  34 54 28 46 41 77 97 102 96 46 45 49 

 
2024/2025 
 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr-24 May-24 
Jun-
24 

Jul-24 Aug-24 Sep-24 

Bond 2 3 5 1 6 5 

Direct 
Medics 

62 61 33 51 88 36 

ID Medical  0 0 0 0 0 0 

Interact 
Medical 

0 0 0 0 0 0 



Locum 
Link 

15 18 26 18 16 8 

Locum 
People 

0 21 9 7 0 0 

National 
Locums 

0 0 0 11 18 9 

NC 
Healthcare  

26 24 30 41 26 15 

TLS 191 195 186 244 203 169 

Medicspro 0 0 1 1 0 0 

TTM 2 4 0 0 0 0 

 

Monthly Overview 

Agency 
Used 

Apr-24 May-24 Jun-24 Jul-24 Aug-24 Sep-24 

Athona 0 0 0 0 0 0 

DRC 
Locums 

0 0 1 0 0 0 

Global 
Medics IE  

18 11 5 0 0 0 

Global 
Medics UK 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

Healthcare 
Resource 
Company 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

Medicircle  1 3 0 0 0 0 

Mediteam  1 0 0 0 0 0 

Nutrix  22 6 13 18 16 9 

PE Global  12 11 11 0 0 0 

Resuscitate  0 0 0 0 0 0 

Surgi-Call  39 68 80 77 57 39 

 
 

5. Please confirm the total number of unfilled vacancies (excluding locum 
filled posts) per month. 

Response:  
 

Monthly Overview 

Total No of 
unfilled 
vacancies 

Apr
-22 

May
-22 

Jun
-22 

Jul-
22 

Aug
-22 

Sep
-22 

Oct
-22 

Nov
-22 

Dec
-22 

Jan
-23 

Feb
-23 

Mar
-23 

159 187 194 
22
8 

 305 191 188 185 294 276 0 42 

 

Monthly Overview 

Total No of 
unfilled 
vacancies 

Apr
-23 

May
-23 

Jun
-23 

Jul
-23 

Aug
-23 

Sep
-23 

Oct
-23 

Nov
-23 

Dec
-23 

Jan
-24 

Feb
-24 

Mar-
24 

 49 41  21  51  134  104 90  90  103  86  41 29 

 

Monthly Overview 

Apr-24 May-24 
Jun-
24 

Jul-24 Aug-24 Sep-24 



 

 

Total No 
of unfilled 
vacancies 

48 19 92 81 42 51 

 
 
Email: FOI.team@southerntrust.hscni.net  

mailto:FOI.team@southerntrust.hscni.net

